
  
 

 

Information Governance Team 

Postal Address: 
Coventry City Council 
PO Box 15 
Council House 
Coventry 
CV1 5RR

www.coventry.gov.uk 

E-mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk 

Phone: 024 7697 5408

10 August 2021 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA) 
Request ID: FOI349881368 

Thank you for your request for information relating to equality in school. 
 
You have requested the following information:
 
1. I am currently doing some work on Equality and would be grateful if you could supply me
with the following information for each of the schools within Coventry schools. 

Name of School 
Number of pupils on roll 
Number of BAME Pupils 
Number of Staff employed 
Number of BAME Staff employed 
Number of Teaching Staff employed 
Number of BAME Staff employed 
Number of Middle Managers employed 
Number of BAME Middle Managers employed 
Number of SLT employed 



Number of BAME SLT employed 

Please see the attached spreadsheet. 

With regards to staff employed, we can confirm that we do not hold this information and are
advising you as per Section 1(1) of the Act. Coventry City Council does not hold HR data for
academies or supply teachers. Whilst we hold records of staff within maintained schools, we do not
hold the information in the breakdown requested. 

You may wish to contact schools direct for this information. Their contact details can be found at
the link below: 

https://www.coventry.gov.uk/directory/10/schools_and_their_contact_details 

2. I would be grateful if you could supply me the number of first choice and second choice
places for the incoming Year 7 into all Schools (including academies and Trusts) for 2019,
2020 and 2021. 

Please see the attached spreadsheet. 

3. I would be grateful if you could supply me the figure that each school within Coventry,
including academies, has spent on Supply Teacher costs for the academic years 2019 - 20
and 2020 - 21. 

The information you requested is being withheld as it falls under the exemption(s) in Section 22 of
the Freedom of Information Act 2000, which relates to Information Intended for Future Publication. 

The information will be published later this year, at the latest by December and will be available to
view at the following link: 

https://schools-financial-benchmarking.service.gov.uk/ 

Please note the information is recorded by financial year not by academic year. 

The supply of information in response to a Freedom of Information request does not confer an
automatic right to re-use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of
private study and non-commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly,
information supplied can also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is
photographs. Please contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose. 
 
For information, we publish a variety of information such as: FOI/EIR Disclosure Log,  Publication
Scheme,  Facts about Coventry and  Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future. 
 
If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to
your original request – email: infogov@coventry.gov.uk
 
If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,



who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email icocasework@ico.org.uk.
 
Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.

Yours faithfully 
  

Information Governance 



January 2021: Ethnic Origin of 

Pupils in Primary Schools 

(Numbers)

Source: DfE School Census - 

January 2021

School White Mixed

Asian or 

Asian 

British

Black or 

Black 

British

Estab British Irish

Traveller 

 Irish 

Heritage

Gypsy/

Roma

Other 

White

Total

White

White/ 

Black 

Caribbean

White/ 

Black 

African

White/

Asian

Other 

Mixed

Total 

Mixed Indian Pakistani

Bangla-

deshi

Other 

Asian

Total

Asian

 

Caribbean  African

Other 

Black

Total

Black Chinese

Other 

Ethnic

 Group

School WBRI WIRI WIRT WROM WOTH WTOT MWBC MWBA MWAS MOTH MTOT AIND APKN ABAN AOTH ATOT BCRB BAFR BOTH BTOT CHNE OOTH

2000 Alderman's Green 277 0 0 0 82 359 4 0 1 37 42 12 2 0 40 54 5 35 22 62 1 10

2131 Aldermoor Farm 164 0 0 0 141 305 7 1 4 6 18 21 7 0 12 40 2 191 4 197 2 2

3008 All Saints' CE 78 2 0 1 11 92 6 2 8 3 19 21 3 6 10 40 1 47 1 49 6 6

3433 All Souls' RC 166 6 0 0 22 194 2 4 1 5 12 3 5 0 2 10 0 8 1 9 0 2

2084 Allesley 338 0 0 0 13 351 9 4 6 5 24 10 2 1 13 26 1 7 0 8 1 2

2076 Allesley Hall 162 0 0 0 1 163 3 4 11 3 21 3 0 0 4 7 0 1 0 1 0 0

2149 Broad Heath Community 42 0 0 1 43 86 7 14 18 47 86 73 192 49 22 336 2 93 6 101 7 53

2107 Cannon Park 86 0 0 0 11 97 2 3 8 6 19 26 9 1 21 57 0 10 3 13 12 5

3436 Charter 173 0 0 0 34 207 8 1 4 6 19 6 3 0 21 30 1 43 13 57 1 9

2001 Christ the King RC 351 22 0 0 27 400 12 1 10 8 31 1 0 1 1 3 0 19 1 20 0 0

2110 Clifford Bridge Academy 272 0 0 3 18 293 13 6 14 7 40 46 8 0 8 62 1 14 2 17 3 7

3434 Corpus Christi RC 122 0 0 0 59 181 8 11 4 10 33 18 0 0 5 23 3 153 13 169 6 1

2130 Coundon 390 1 1 0 30 422 18 5 19 11 53 35 34 4 15 88 1 19 0 20 1 2

2009 Courthouse Green 331 2 0 0 43 376 30 5 20 16 71 46 49 4 34 133 7 59 3 69 3 4

2013 Earlsdon 263 0 0 1 18 282 9 2 13 12 36 25 6 5 15 51 1 13 3 17 4 9

2095 Eastern Green Junior 199 0 0 0 5 204 2 1 5 2 10 4 0 0 2 6 1 2 0 3 1 1

2015 Edgewick Community 29 0 0 31 79 139 0 5 7 9 21 11 96 32 34 173 2 20 4 26 1 9

2078 Ernesford Grange 318 0 0 0 16 334 5 6 11 4 26 84 8 0 3 95 1 20 0 21 2 1

2124 Finham 183 0 0 0 4 187 2 3 13 6 24 148 32 16 17 213 0 9 1 10 3 2

2145 Frederick Bird 115 1 0 48 131 295 15 19 17 14 65 60 34 88 70 252 6 134 8 148 0 23

3414 Good Shepherd RC 87 2 0 0 52 141 6 8 1 8 23 8 0 0 13 21 0 43 4 47 2 2

2021 Gosford Park 127 0 0 4 90 221 9 5 9 11 34 30 14 2 27 73 6 76 3 85 2 8

2092 Grange Farm 149 1 0 0 6 156 9 1 11 3 24 193 23 5 6 227 0 9 0 9 4 1

2091 Grangehurst 228 0 0 0 21 249 13 5 9 16 43 26 5 2 39 72 1 11 7 19 0 17

2018 Hearsall Community 205 0 0 0 48 253 16 5 14 10 45 25 19 3 22 69 1 19 1 21 1 6

2156 Henley Green 167 0 7 3 52 229 15 12 2 15 44 3 4 5 6 18 5 102 14 121 1 11

2010 Hill Farm (Academy) 201 0 7 4 87 299 12 8 12 15 47 28 38 4 47 117 7 62 3 72 1 10

2125 Holbrook 51 0 0 44 83 178 7 3 9 8 27 43 218 6 64 331 1 59 17 77 2 3

2008 Hollyfast 412 1 0 0 25 438 21 1 9 10 41 52 34 2 22 110 4 5 5 14 0 8

3435 Holy Family RC 287 10 0 0 64 361 8 0 3 19 30 10 4 0 30 44 0 12 7 19 0 0

3437 Howes 87 0 0 0 11 98 3 1 2 3 9 6 5 10 9 30 2 15 0 17 0 0

2140 John Gulson 29 0 0 15 32 76 6 1 8 13 28 61 122 67 56 306 2 61 2 65 0 19

2151 John Shelton 109 0 0 0 25 134 1 3 2 14 20 22 0 0 31 53 0 17 3 20 1 12

2121 Joseph Cash 123 0 1 2 64 190 11 3 17 9 40 32 54 3 67 156 1 45 1 47 1 20

2034 Keresley Grange 219 1 0 0 16 236 8 3 0 10 21 11 0 0 7 18 1 5 4 10 0 0



3302 Leigh CE 172 1 1 0 10 184 9 5 1 3 18 1 0 0 2 3 0 9 3 12 3 2

2157 Limbrick Wood 118 0 0 0 16 134 1 4 0 5 10 0 0 1 12 13 1 19 4 24 0 0

2037 Little Heath 37 0 0 2 60 99 8 1 8 9 26 30 26 2 34 92 1 39 1 41 0 7

2150 Longford Park 85 0 0 0 17 102 6 1 3 2 12 45 25 1 14 85 0 11 0 11 0 10

2141 Manor Park 296 3 0 0 55 354 14 10 16 20 60 168 36 27 41 272 4 29 3 36 10 14

2158 Moathouse Community 145 0 2 0 81 228 12 9 1 18 40 0 2 1 4 7 5 81 27 113 1 43

2147 Moseley 188 2 0 1 36 227 25 6 14 18 63 27 64 5 17 113 8 23 1 32 5 11

2154 Mount Nod 257 1 0 0 10 268 8 4 6 2 20 7 2 0 5 14 0 7 0 7 5 4

3408 Our Lady of the Assumption 121 2 0 0 24 147 3 0 0 6 9 2 0 0 2 4 0 43 1 44 1 9

2101 Park Hill 366 1 11 1 17 396 13 2 11 4 30 11 2 1 8 22 2 9 0 11 3 0

2138 Parkgate 252 1 0 0 60 313 19 7 20 6 52 115 48 0 73 236 9 59 1 69 0 4

2117 Pearl Hyde 106 0 0 0 10 116 8 5 4 4 21 54 6 1 11 72 3 26 0 29 2 4

2079 Potters Green 247 0 0 0 31 278 15 6 4 5 30 9 11 0 4 24 2 53 0 55 3 0

2014 Radford Primary Academy 67 0 0 0 19 86 4 1 6 6 17 9 19 4 40 72 2 12 2 16 0 39

2132 Ravensdale 303 1 0 0 19 323 7 1 10 5 23 56 12 4 11 83 3 15 1 19 0 8

2143 Richard Lee 265 1 0 0 51 317 7 0 0 24 31 24 1 6 27 58 2 19 16 37 3 18

3404 Sacred Heart RC 167 3 0 0 97 267 7 8 2 11 28 44 0 0 3 47 1 92 2 95 4 2

2017 Whittle Academy 126 0 1 3 25 155 13 2 3 1 19 31 2 0 8 41 2 17 0 19 0 0

2153 Southfields 50 0 0 2 47 99 10 5 7 8 30 30 11 4 60 105 2 134 8 144 7 20

2118 Sowe Valley 129 0 0 0 20 149 15 3 3 1 22 2 2 0 3 7 0 11 0 11 1 3

2155 Spon Gate 90 0 1 0 17 108 5 6 6 2 19 8 1 1 20 30 1 86 6 93 6 26

3415 SS Peter & Paul RC 79 0 1 0 21 101 5 3 7 3 18 14 0 0 6 20 0 43 0 43 0 2

3009 St Andrew's CE Infant 155 0 0 0 1 156 3 1 2 4 10 1 2 0 2 5 0 1 0 1 4 0

3418 St Anne's RC 78 1 0 0 30 109 6 8 3 6 23 9 3 0 5 17 3 73 3 79 1 0

3422 St Augustine's RC 151 4 0 0 106 261 7 12 0 7 26 9 3 0 25 37 4 60 4 68 4 5

2007 St Bartholomew's CE 155 0 0 0 7 162 10 3 2 1 16 10 2 0 0 12 1 36 3 40 0 2

2054 St Christopher 333 1 0 0 14 348 13 1 13 12 39 8 24 1 9 42 1 12 1 14 0 4

3405 St Elizabeth's RC 34 0 0 2 27 63 2 3 2 3 10 21 26 1 27 75 1 74 3 78 0 2

3423 St Gregory's RC 107 2 0 0 15 124 3 1 2 3 9 15 1 1 6 23 1 46 4 51 0 1

3409 St John Fisher RC 290 10 0 0 21 321 10 5 5 7 27 44 4 1 5 54 1 39 4 44 3 3

3412 St John Vianney RC 153 5 0 0 13 171 1 3 6 3 13 1 1 0 1 3 3 10 4 17 2 1

3301 St John's CE (Academy) 178 0 0 0 8 186 1 2 6 4 13 0 0 0 2 2 1 7 0 8 1 2

2004 St Laurence's CE (Academy) 191 0 0 1 23 215 12 3 10 9 34 44 16 5 28 93 2 22 4 28 1 15

3010 St Mary and St. Benedict 60 1 0 0 27 88 8 3 4 19 34 31 3 9 5 48 2 150 6 158 6 9

3406 St Osburg's RC 52 0 0 0 48 100 8 6 4 4 22 8 3 0 2 13 1 70 4 75 3 2

3411 St Patrick's RC 45 1 2 0 46 94 4 6 2 4 16 2 0 0 5 7 0 96 3 99 0 0

3432 St Thomas More RC 203 1 0 0 48 252 6 1 7 14 28 27 2 3 20 52 4 22 14 40 0 8

2056 Stanton Bridge 23 0 0 25 68 116 5 2 5 14 26 24 34 35 59 152 1 77 10 88 1 6

2136 Stivichall 272 1 1 1 21 296 9 7 22 13 51 122 16 4 13 155 1 8 0 9 1 10

2129 Stoke 130 1 0 8 69 208 6 3 9 11 29 52 18 6 43 119 1 36 6 43 0 16

2152 Stoke Heath 157 2 0 3 80 242 8 11 13 16 48 43 32 13 25 113 4 40 4 48 0 29

2005 Stretton CE Academy 96 0 0 3 16 115 7 3 2 2 14 21 1 0 5 27 2 28 1 31 0 1

2142 Templars 394 0 0 0 40 434 13 6 9 13 41 17 10 0 20 47 1 41 5 47 3 6

3006 Walsgrave CE Academy 176 0 0 0 15 191 12 9 14 7 42 116 14 0 30 160 5 40 4 49 1 4

2068 Whitley Abbey 191 0 0 1 31 223 4 4 7 10 25 47 3 2 10 62 2 16 0 18 3 6

2135 Whitmore Park 344 1 0 1 36 382 13 8 29 19 69 89 27 1 28 145 5 33 9 47 0 4

2122 Whoberley Hall 153 1 0 0 11 165 4 2 1 13 20 2 3 0 2 7 0 7 4 11 1 8

3438 Willenhall Community 255 0 0 0 27 282 6 7 2 10 25 10 6 1 3 20 1 90 11 102 2 2

2146 Wyken Croft 511 1 1 0 55 568 35 11 19 5 70 99 35 14 54 202 7 38 7 52 0 2

4004 Seva 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 3 5 8 243 0 0 12 255 1 0 0 1 0 0



2016 Sidney Stringer Primary 24 0 0 6 13 43 5 3 8 20 36 57 44 57 34 192 5 52 6 63 0 27

PRI City Primary 15,117 98 37 217 3,123 18,592 742 379 645 802 2,568 3,062 1,633 528 1,680 6,903 175 3,499 356 4,030 160 666

EIC 18190



Total

Known

Not 

Known

Total on 

Roll BAME BAME

TKNO SumUnk TALL

528 0 528 169 169

564 0 564 259 259

212 5 217 125 120

227 0 227 33 33

412 1 413 62 61

192 0 192 29 29

669 2 671 585 583

203 0 203 106 106

323 4 327 120 116

454 2 456 56 54

422 3 425 132 129

413 9 422 241 232

586 15 601 179 164

656 18 674 298 280

399 1 400 118 117

225 5 230 26 21

369 26 395 256 230

479 0 479 145 145

439 11 450 263 252

783 7 790 495 488

236 1 237 96 95

423 1 424 203 202

421 2 423 267 265

400 2 402 153 151

395 6 401 148 142

424 5 429 200 195

546 5 551 252 247

618 21 639 461 440

611 7 618 180 173

454 0 454 93 93

154 0 154 56 56

494 11 505 429 418

240 6 246 112 106

454 5 459 269 264

285 4 289 53 49



222 1 223 39 38

181 1 182 48 47

265 5 270 171 166

220 5 225 123 118

746 11 757 403 392

432 0 432 204 204

451 10 461 234 224

318 3 321 53 50

214 2 216 69 67

462 1 463 67 66

674 10 684 371 361

244 6 250 134 128

390 6 396 118 112

230 1 231 145 144

456 3 459 136 133

464 0 464 147 147

443 4 447 180 176

234 8 242 87 79

405 2 407 308 306

193 4 197 48 44

282 1 283 175 174

184 3 187 86 83

176 0 176 20 20

229 0 229 120 120

401 1 402 141 140

232 0 232 70 70

447 3 450 102 99

228 1 229 166 165

208 2 210 86 84

452 2 454 133 131

207 0 207 36 36

212 1 213 27 26

386 16 402 187 171

343 2 345 257 255

215 1 216 116 115

216 1 217 123 122

380 0 380 128 128

389 5 394 278 273

522 5 527 231 226

415 7 422 214 207

480 3 483 241 238

188 2 190 75 73

578 5 583 149 144

447 3 450 259 256

337 8 345 122 114

647 13 660 278 265

212 0 212 47 47

433 10 443 161 151

894 7 901 333 326

264 3 267 267 264



361 1 362 319 318

32,919 374 33,293 14701 14,327

32403



January 2021: Ethnic Origin of 

Pupils in Secondary Schools 

(Numbers)

Source: DfE School Census - 

January 2021

School White Mixed

Asian or 

Asian 

British

Black or 

Black 

British

Estab British Irish

Traveller 

 Irish 

Heritage

Gypsy/

Roma

Other 

White

Total

White

White/ 

Black 

Caribbean

White/ 

Black 

African

White/

Asian

Other 

Mixed

Total 

Mixed Indian Pakistani

Bangla-

deshi

Other 

Asian

Total

Asian

 

Caribbean  African

Other 

Black

Total

Black Chinese

School WBRI WIRI WIRT WROM WOTH WTOT MWBC MWBA MWAS MOTH MTOT AIND APKN ABAN AOTH ATOT BCRB BAFR BOTH BTOT CHNE

4000 Barr's Hill 230 1 1 10 159 401 14 6 7 17 44 34 59 12 53 158 9 89 9 107 3

4701 Bishop Ullathorne RC 533 10 0 0 77 620 12 12 5 15 44 35 4 2 17 58 7 242 25 274 3

4800 Blue Coat CE (Academy) 601 1 0 2 111 715 29 26 32 28 115 138 44 18 68 268 27 424 37 488 12

4028 Caludon Castle (Academy) 996 3 0 0 45 1,044 45 12 32 13 102 175 35 6 68 284 6 80 10 96 6

4707 Cardinal Newman RC 756 27 0 1 157 941 35 12 17 14 78 60 22 3 63 148 7 156 13 176 1

4007 Cardinal Wiseman RC 453 6 0 2 124 585 33 21 22 28 104 81 12 3 87 183 11 332 30 373 0

4026 Coundon Court (Academy) 1,095 4 0 0 83 1,182 43 8 38 15 104 96 128 6 109 339 12 46 10 68 9

4002 Eden Girl's School 0 0 0 0 9 9 0 3 6 22 31 34 223 54 64 375 3 125 3 131 0

4001

Ernesford Grange Community 

Academy 513 3 0 0 92 608 19 11 7 12 49 24 3 2 22 51 5 95 13 113 4

4037 Finham Park (Academy) 804 2 0 0 50 856 29 7 30 22 88 316 68 53 51 488 3 45 9 57 10

4006 Finham Park 2 451 1 1 0 27 480 14 6 10 8 38 17 10 1 26 54 6 36 7 49 0

4010 Foxford 408 0 0 16 97 521 35 10 22 15 82 121 115 12 44 292 10 50 12 72 0

6905 Grace Academy 332 0 1 7 76 416 30 10 15 11 66 10 23 5 34 72 9 135 14 158 0

4030 Lyng Hall 332 1 1 26 177 537 16 13 14 10 53 60 71 11 16 158 9 56 4 69 1

4034 President Kennedy (Academy) 672 3 0 5 125 805 50 11 56 26 143 226 172 12 141 551 10 137 14 161 3

4004 Seva 9 0 0 0 10 19 2 0 0 8 10 200 0 1 17 218 1 2 0 3 0

6906 Sidney Stringer Academy 97 1 0 28 99 225 18 11 25 38 92 126 281 226 125 758 11 262 20 293 2

4008 Stoke Park 497 4 0 13 111 625 22 4 21 23 70 110 34 21 38 203 6 57 6 69 1

4043 The Westwood Academy 439 0 1 4 49 493 15 8 14 9 46 15 5 3 29 52 3 45 11 59 1

4033 West Coventry Academy 760 4 0 0 55 819 28 12 9 20 69 24 46 4 28 102 3 82 9 94 5

4011 Whitley Academy 493 2 0 3 72 570 25 12 12 23 72 23 4 1 26 54 10 119 19 148 1

4011 Whitley Academy 493 2 0 3 72 570 25 12 12 23 72 23 4 1 26 54 10 119 19 148 1

4003 WMG Academy 215 2 0 0 30 247 7 5 7 19 38 32 3 2 15 52 4 64 9 77 0

SEC City Secondary 11,179 77 5 120 1,907 13,288 546 232 413 419 1,610 1,980 1,366 459 1,167 4,972 182 2,798 303 3,283 63



Other 

Ethnic

 Group

Total

Known

Not 

Known

Total on 

Roll BAME BAME

OOTH TKNO SumUnk TALL

45 758 14 772 371 357

7 1,006 8 1,014 394 386

20 1,618 52 1,670 955 903

18 1,550 0 1,550 506 506

6 1,350 16 1,366 425 409

15 1,260 6 1,266 681 675

26 1,728 6 1,734 552 546

36 582 17 599 590 573

12 837 16 853 245 229

21 1,520 8 1,528 672 664

5 626 3 629 149 146

23 990 13 1,003 482 469

14 726 6 732 316 310

28 846 5 851 314 309

32 1,695 24 1,719 914 890

0 250 8 258 239 231

75 1,445 17 1,462 1,237 1,220

20 988 23 1,011 386 363

9 660 14 674 181 167

8 1,097 20 1,117 298 278

9 854 15 869 299 284

9 854 15 869 299 284

7 421 37 458 211 174

445 23,661 343 24,004 10,716 10,373



January 2021: Ethnic Origin of 

Pupils in Special Schools 

(Numbers)

Source: DfE School Census - 

January 2021

School White Mixed

Asian or 

Asian 

British

Black or 

Black 

British

DfES No British Irish

Traveller 

 Irish 

Heritage

Gypsy/

Roma

Other 

White

Total

White

White/ 

Black 

Caribbean

White/ 

Black 

African

White/

Asian

Other 

Mixed

Total 

Mixed Indian Pakistani

Bangla-

deshi

Other 

Asian

Total

Asian

 

Caribbean  African

Other 

Black

Total

Black Chinese

School WBRI WIRI WIRT WROM WOTH WTOT MWBC MWBA MWAS MOTH MTOT AIND APKN ABAN AOTH ATOT BCRB BAFR BOTH BTOT CHNE

7002 Riverbank Academy 67 0 0 2 14 83 13 1 1 3 18 11 9 4 13 37 1 20 4 25 0

7019 Baginton Fields 46 0 1 0 5 52 1 0 1 2 4 10 8 4 11 33 2 13 4 19 0

7024 Castle Wood 52 1 0 0 6 59 6 5 2 4 17 13 15 5 10 43 1 25 2 28 1

7022 Corley Centre 84 1 0 0 4 89 0 1 1 0 2 5 3 0 2 10 2 5 4 11 0

7000 RNIB Three Spires Academy 32 0 0 0 6 38 3 2 2 3 10 6 4 1 6 17 0 13 1 14 0

7009 Sherbourne Fields 106 1 0 0 12 119 6 3 11 8 28 11 19 2 12 44 0 6 2 8 0

7017 Tiverton 32 0 0 0 8 40 2 1 0 3 6 8 5 1 11 25 2 15 8 25 1

7021 Woodfield 120 0 0 0 5 125 9 2 0 4 15 0 0 0 1 1 2 5 1 8 0

SPE City Special 539 3 1 2 60 605 40 15 18 27 100 64 63 17 66 210 10 102 26 138 2



Other 

Ethnic

 Group

Total

Known

Not 

Known

Total on 

Roll BAME BAME

OOTH TKNO SumUnk TALL

3 166 9 175 92 83

5 113 3 116 64 61

5 153 3 156 97 94

0 112 0 112 23 23

0 79 5 84 46 41

1 200 1 201 82 81

4 101 0 101 61 61

0 149 1 150 25 24

18 1073 22 1095 490 468



Preferences

2019 2020

1st 

preference

2nd 

preference

1st 

preference

2nd 

preference

School Alloc Alloc Alloc Alloc

Barr's Hill School & Community College 94 23 112 29

Bishop Ullathorne Catholic School 159 15 161 15

Blue Coat CE School & Music College 235 20 235 24

Caludon Castle School 256 10 232 6

Cardinal Newman Catholic School 216 29 217 22

Cardinal Wiseman Catholic School 107 40 147 26

Coundon Court 260 50 229 37

Eden Girls' School 108 8 111 6

Ernesford Grange Community Academy 101 20 113 18

Finham Park 2 114 4 111 9

Finham Park Mathematics and Computing 

Colle 216 23 205 31

Foxford School 135 21 128 24

Grace Academy Coventry 93 19 94 20

Lyng Hall School 103 42 116 15

President Kennedy School 290 9 317 12

Seva School 41 6 19 4

Sidney Stringer Academy 230 9 200 8

Stoke Park School 128 40 144 23

The Westwood Academy 63 27 78 35

West Coventry Academy 142 38 161 31

Whitley Academy 137 32 107 26

3228 485 3237 421



2021

1st 

preference

2nd 

preference

Alloc Alloc

125 38

183 15

220 28

224 10

209 32

126 20

284 41

112 7

151 39

114 6

232 26

143 20

97 26

108 28

289 9

45 3

190 16

132 36

90 31

124 26

91 18

3289 475


