
 

Information Governance Team 

Postal Address: 

Coventry City Council 

PO Box 15 

Council House 

Coventry 

CV1 5RR 

www.coventry.gov.uk 
E-mail: infogov@coventry.gov.uk 
Phone: 024 7697 5408

09 February 2024 

Dear Sir/Madam 

Environmental Information Regulations 2004 (EIR) 
Request ID: FOI584691504 

Thank you for your request for information relating to feedstock for the incinerator.
 
You have requested the following information:
 
1. Can I please see any documentation, emails, notes, or other recorded material which
breaks down the feedstock for the incinerator. 

We confirm that we do not hold this information and are advising you as per Regulation 12(4)(a) of
the EIR. We do not hold this information, this is held by CSWDC. Their contact details can be found
on the following link: 

https://www.cswdc.co.uk/ 

2. Which collections are fed into the incinerator? What is included in those collections? Do
you have any breakdown b- by category, weight, or volume - of what the feedstock consists
of? [plastics, paper, cardboard, building materials, compostable waste collected by the
council, garden waste, industrial waste, other? 

3. Do you have any figures on how much waste collected in the city,[by weight or volume] is
burnt? which is recycled [by weight or volume]? which goes to landfill [by weight or
volume]? Which has some other destination? for the last 5 years. 

For Questions 2 and 3, please see the attached. 



4. Do you have any corresponding figures for the other local authorities which also send
waste to the incinerator – how much do they send? What is it composed up? 

We confirm that we do not hold this information and are advising you as per Regulation 12(4)(a) of
the EIR. We do not hold this information, queries would have to be directed to each neighbouring
authority.
 
The supply of information in response to a FOI/EIR request does not confer an automatic right to
re-use the information. You can use any information supplied for the purposes of private study and
non-commercial research without requiring further permission. Similarly, information supplied can
also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting. An exception to this is photographs. Please
contact us if you wish to use the information for any other purpose. 
 
For information, we publish a variety of information such as:  FOI/EIR Disclosure Log,  Publication
Scheme,  Facts about Coventry and   Open Data that you may find of useful if you are looking for
information in the future. 
 
If you are unhappy with the handling of your request, you can ask us to review our response.
Requests for reviews should be submitted within 40 days of the date of receipt of our response to
your original request – email:  infogov@coventry.gov.uk
 
If you are unhappy with the outcome of our review, you can write to the Information Commissioner,
who can be contacted at: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane,
Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or email  icocasework@ico.org.uk.
 
Please remember to quote the reference number above in your response.
 

Yours faithfully 
  

Information Governance



2. Which collections are fed into the 

incinerator? What is included in those 

collections? Do you have any breakdown 

b- by category, weight, or volume - of 

what the feedstock consists of? [plastics, 

paper, cardboard, building materials, 

Coventry City Councils Current Collections 

Delivered Direct to EFW at CSWDC Ltd 

Residual household waste 240 Litre wheeled bin collected fortnightly

Trade Bulk Bin Waste variety of containment sizes

Street Cleansing Bagged waste mixed 

litter bins variety of containment sizes

https://www.coventry.gov.uk/greenbin

Materials accepted in Residual Household 

Black bagged waste

Polysterene 

Nappies / Sanitary products

Used tissues

Thin plastic film

Food waste (if no brown lidded bin)

3. Do you have any figures on how much 

waste collected in the city,[by weight or 

volume] is burnt? which is recycled [by 

weight or volume]? which goes to landfill 

[by weight or volume]? Which has some 

Financial Year

Household Collections 2018.2019 2019.202 2020.2021 2021.2022 2022.2023

Household waste sent for Incineration 85227.16 75567.85 76620.93 78468.76 73822.24

Household Waste Recycled 24060.75 22673.88 23485.81 17991.99 19833.28

Household Waste Sent for Composting 20105.79 20126.55 21090.03 16969.3 16724.64

Municipal Waste Sent to Landfill 12166.95 10588.27 7486.68 7672.88 1790.95


